
UPDATES

BritBox

Agatha Christie’s Partners in Crime - 9/22 -
Francesca Annis (Bancroft) and James Warwick
(Iron Man) star as the famous crime-fighting
duo, Tommy and Tuppence Beresford, as they
solve mysteries and search for enemy spies in
1950’s Britain. In this adaptation, our two
sleuths are now married and well-established
as secret agents working under the watchful
eye of Scotland Yard.

Last Night of the Proms - 9/12 - For those
not familiar with the BBC Proms, it's an eight-
week series of classical concerts held annually
in London. The “Last Night of the Proms” is
quite different from the other nights, taking
place on the second Saturday in September
with widespread broadcast. The concert
usually features some lighter classics and
then a second half consisting of patriotic
British pieces (like Henry Wood's “Fantasia on
British Sea Songs” and Thomas Arne's “Rule,
Britannia!”).

McDonald & Dodds - 9/1 - BAFTA-winner
Jason Watkins (The Crown, Trollied) stars
alongside newcomer Tala Gouveia in this fun
detective drama that's not quite cozy, but still
far from gritty. The two-part series is set in
Bath, England and it follows an incredibly
mismatched but competent pair as they learn
to work together to solve difficult cases.

Moving On, Season 10 - 9/8 - This drama
anthology offers contemporary stories of
people experiencing big changes in their lives.
Whether it's a couple dealing with infidelity or
a family losing a loved one, each story is
about change.

Pride & Prejudice, Remastered - 9/25 -
Though the 1995 version of the classic is

already on BritBox, this release is a
remastered edition.

This Farming Life, Season 4 - 9/18 - This
BAFTA-winning documentary series returns,
following the ups and downs of new farming
families in Scotland and Northern Ireland as
they face tough economic times and an
uncertain future.

Netflix

Criminal UK, Series 2 - 9/16 - This crime
anthology series is set within the confines of a
London police interrogation room where
skilled professionals play psychological games
to get important details from suspects.

The Duchess - 9/11 - Canadian comedian
Katherine Ryan stars in this comedy based on
her life as a single mother in London. Though
estranged from the father of her child, she
debates having another child with him, or
possibly using a sperm donor to reproduce.

Enola Holmes - 9/23 - Millie Bobby Brown
(Intruders) stars as Enola Holmes, the clever
little sister of Sherlock Holmes. The film is
based on the Enola Holmes novels by Nancy
Springer.

Jack Whitehall: Travels with My Father,
Season 4 - 9/22 - This travelling father-son
duo returns for another season of hilarious
scenarios and misunderstandings.

Michael McIntyre: Showman - 9/15 - British
comedian Michael McIntyre performs a
standup special shot live in London.

Since printing and shipping takes several weeks (even longer during these chaotic times),
we wanted to include an additional list of shows announced after the guide went to print.

You can also access a printer-friendly copy of this list at:
https://www.iheartbritishtv.com/usautumn2020



HBO & HBO Max

Doctor Who, Season 12 - 9/1 - HBO Max will
air the most recent season of this British sci-fi
classic, currently featuring Jodie Whittaker
(Broadchurch) as the Doctor.

The Great Pottery Throw Down - TBD - HBO
Max only - This competition series sets out to
find the UK’s best home potter. Seasons 1-3
will be premiering on HBO Max.

His Dark Materials, Season 2 - November -
Philip Pullman’s fantasy trilogy continues with
another seven episodes that will see our
young heroes Lyra and Will taking their first
steps into a new universe.

The Murders at White House Farm - 9/24 -
HBO Max only - This dramatized true crime
series tells the story of a gruesome, multi-
generational family murder that took place at
an isolated farm more than 30 years ago. The
miniseries stars Freddie Fox (Year of the
Rabbit), Mark Addy (New Blood), Stephen
Graham (The Virtues), and Gemma Whelan
(Gentleman Jack).

The Third Day - 9/14 - This six-part series
sees Jude Law playing Sam, a man who’s
strangely drawn to an island off the coast of
Great Britain. When he arrives, he finds a
group of islanders intent on preserving their
way of life, no matter the cost.

Sundance Now

River - 9/10 - Stellan Skarsgård, Nicola Walker,
and Lesley Manville star in this series about a
brilliant police officer haunted by guilt.

Prime Video

The Crimson Field - 9/1 - At a busy WWI
hospital, Kitty volunteers in an attempt to
escape her past.

George Gently - 9/1 - Inspector George
Gently and DS Bacchus chase criminals in the
1960's in Northeast England.

Keeping Faith, Season 1 - 9/1 - A Welsh
lawyer cuts her maternity leave short when
her husband goes missing. As she tries to
solve the crime before she’s arrested for it,
she finds herself knee-deep in the criminal
underworld of her small town. Eve Myles
(Torchwood) stars, though some might argue
her yellow anorak deserves a mention, too.

Peacock

Departure - 9/17 - Partially filmed in the UK,
this Canadian series follows the mystery of
Flight 716, a passenger plane that vanishes
over the Atlantic Ocean. After the crash,
talented aviation investigator is called in to
locate survivors and make sense of what
happened.

I Hate Suzie - TBD - Billie Piper (Doctor Who)
stars in this series about a celebrity whose
phone is hacked, exposing some very
compromising photos.

Noughts & Crosses - 9/4 - This six-episode
drama takes place in a world where racial
politics are reversed. In its past, Africa
colonised Europe, and the present is marred
by segregation laws that preserve the power
dynamic. With that world as the backdrop, it
tells the story of two young lovers fighting
against the system.


